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March 28, 2007                                        D06-45 

 
388

th
 REPORT OF THE ACADEMIC POLICY AND PLANNING COMMITTEE 

 
TO SENATE 

 
 
I. TO BE APPROVED BY SENATE 

 
(A) NEW TEACHING PROGRAMS AND MAJOR REVISIONS TO TEACHING PROGRAMS 

 

None. 
          

(B) CHANGE IN DEPARTMENT NAME AND MERGERS 
 

None 
 

(C) CHANGE IN DEGREE DESIGNATION 

 
None. 
 

(D) ACADEMIC PERFORMANCE ISSUES / POLICIES / GOVERNANCE 
 

None. 

 
(E) CREATION OF NEW UNITS / INTER-UNIVERSITY PARTNERSHIPS 
 

None.            
 
 

II. APPROVED IN THE NAME OF SENATE 

 
(A) Student Exchange Agreements (approved by APPC) 

 
1)  Co-operation Agreement between McGill University and the Sauvé Scholars Foundation 

 
At a meeting on 15

th
 March 2007 APPC approved an Agreement that serves to formalize the 

relationship between the Sauvé Scholars Foundation and McGill University. The Sauvé Scholars 
Foundation was established by the Jeanne Sauvé Foundation to implement its mission of developing 
the leadership potential of promising youth from around the world “… to be used towards making a 
difference and building a better future for the societies of tomorrow.” The Foundation gathers in 
Montreal a highly-talented and motivated group of post-graduate emerging leaders in order for them to 
share an experience of inquiry, debate and reflection, and help advance their careers, intellectual 
capacity and leadership potential (from www.sauvescholars.org). McGill and the Sauvé Foundation 
collaborate to provide the Sauvé Scholars access to a university environment The terms specific to 
McGill are detailed in the Agreement.  Under the provisions of the “Sauvé Scholars at McGill” program, 
the Sauvé Scholars (who hold the status of “stagiaire / academic trainee” and currently number about 
fourteen) are assigned Mentors, are permitted to attend teaching activities with certain conditions, and 
are given access to McGill’s libraries and other specific facilities.  The Agreement has an initial term of 
three years and may be renewed on the same terms and conditions for an additional three years upon 
mutual written agreement executed six months prior to the end of the present term. 
 
2) Bilateral Student Exchange Agreement between McGill University and Université de Montréal 

 
At a meeting on 15

th
 March 2007 APPC approved an Agreement for a Student Exchange Program 

between the Université de Montréal and McGill University.  This agreement differs from McGill’s other 
student exchanges in that it will operate under the umbrella of the Quebec Inter-University Transfer 
(IUT) Agreement: the IUT agreement allows regular degree students who are registered in one Quebec 
university to take courses at another Quebec university with academic credits transferred between the 
two institutions (all requests are routed through a CREPUQ intranet site).  Currently, McGill does not 
authorize more than three credits per session.  This agreement is a significant departure in that students 
would be expected to take no less than a full credit load and spend one term or two at the partner 
institution. The proposed agreement sets the number of undergraduate students to be exchanged in a 
given year at 50, which is considerably higher than any other agreement. Given the unique 
circumstances of this exchange, it is hoped that a substantial cohort of undergraduate students will be 
willing to participate.   

http://www.sauvescholars.org/
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(B) Program Revisions (approved by the Subcommittee on Courses and Programs of APPC on 25
th
 

January and 8
th

 February 2007) 
       
         1) Faculty of Agricultural and Environmental Sciences 

  
                    Ph.D. in Plant Science (0 cr.) 

                    Program revisions: 
                 •  three Thesis Required Courses deleted; 
                 • Complementary Courses descriptive sentence revised. 
                Revised program approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
                Ph.D. in Plant Science; Bioinformatics (0 cr.) 

                Program revisions: 
                • three Thesis Required Courses deleted. 
                Revised program approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
                Ph.D. in Plant Science; Neotropical Environment (0 cr.) 

                Program revisions: 
                • three Thesis Required Courses deleted. 
                Revised program approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
                B.Sc.(Ag.Env.Sc.); Major in Applied Zoology (90 cr.) 

                Program revisions: 
                • two Required Courses consolidated into one. 
                Revised program approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
                B.Sc.(Ag.Env.Sc.); Major in Environmental Biology (90 cr.) 

                Program revisions: 
                • two Required Courses consolidated into one. 
                Revised program approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
                B.Sc.(Ag.Env.Sc.); Major in Wildlife Biology (90 cr.) 

                Program revisions: 
                • two Required Courses consolidated into one. 
                Revised program approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
                B.Sc.(Ag.Env.Sc.); Major in Resource Conservation (90 cr.) 

                Program revisions: 
                • two Required Courses consolidated into one; 
                • one Complementary Course deleted. 
                Program revisions approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
                   Ph.D. in Animal Science; Bioinformatics (0 cr.) 

                   Program revision: 
                • one Complementary Course added. 
              Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
              Ph.D. in Microbiology; Bioinformatics (0 cr.) 

                   Program revision: 
                • one Complementary Course added. 
              Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
              M.Sc. in Parasitology; Bioinformatics (47 cr.) 

                  Program revision: 
                • one Complementary Course added. 
             Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
             Ph.D. in Parasitology; Bioinformatics (0 cr.) 

                  Program revision: 
               • one Complementary Course added. 
             Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
             Ph.D. in Parasitology (0 cr.) 

             Program revision: 
               • description. 
               Program revision approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 
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             M.Sc. in Plant Science; Bioinformatics (48 cr.) 

                  Program revision: 
               • one Complementary Course added. 
             Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
             Ph.D. in Plant Science; Bioinformatics (0 cr.) 

                  Program revision: 
               • one Complementary Course added. 
             Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
             Ph.D. in Food Science and Agricultural Chemistry (0 cr.) 

             Program revisions: 
               • one Required Course added; 
               • two Required Courses titles changed; 
               • Required Courses credit weight increased. 
               Program revisions approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
              M.Sc. in Food Science and Agricultural Chemistry; Non-Thesis (45 cr.) 

              Program revision: 
                • one Complementary Course added. 
                Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
           2)   Faculty of Arts 

 
          M.A. in Economics; Non-Thesis (45 cr.) 

          Program revisions: 
          • two Required Courses deleted; 
          • one Required Course added; 
          • Required Courses credit weight decreased; 
           • Complementary Courses descriptive sentence revised; 
          • program credit weight decreased. 
          Program revisions approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
          M.A. in Economics; Non-Thesis - Social Statistics (45 cr.) 

          Program revisions: 
          • two Required Courses deleted; 
          • one Required Course added; 
          • Required Courses credit weight decreased; 
          • Complementary Courses descriptive sentence revised; 
          • program credit weight decreased. 
          Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
          Ph.D. in Economics (0 cr.) 

          Program revisions: 
          • three Required Courses specified; 
          • fields specified; 
          • “Other field combinations …” descriptive sentence added. 
          Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
          M.A. in Geography (48 cr.) 

          Program revision: 
          • Complementary Courses descriptive paragraph revised. 
          Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
          M.A. in Sociology; Non-Thesis (45 cr.) 

          Program revisions: 
          • two Required Courses added; 
          • one Required Course deleted; 
          • Complementary Courses descriptive sentence revised. 
          Program revisions approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007.  

 
          M.A. in Sociology; Non-Thesis – Social Statistics (45 cr.) 

          Program revisions: 
          • two Required Courses added; 
          • one Required Course deleted; 
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          • one Required Course split into two courses; 
          • Complementary Courses descriptive sentence revised. 
          Program revisions approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007.  

 
          Ph.D. in Political Science (0 cr.) 

          Program revisions: 
          • “Minor Field (2 courses” deleted; 
          • “Additional Courses” increased and descriptive sentence revised. 
                Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
           3)  Faculty of Education 
 
                B.Sc.(Kinesiology); Honours in Kinesiology (90 cr.) 

                Program revisions: 
                • one Required Course added; 
                • Required Courses credit weight increased; 
                • one Complementary Course deleted; 
                • Elective Courses credit weight decreased. 
                Program revisions approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
                B.Sc.(Kinesiology); Major in Applied Kinesiology (90 cr.) 

                Program revisions: 
                • one Required Course added; 
                • Required Courses credit weight increased; 
                • Elective Courses credit weight decreased. 
                Program revisions approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
               B.Sc.(Kinesiology); Major in General Kinesiology (90 cr.) 

               Program revisions: 
               • one Required Course added; 
               • Required Courses credit weight increased; 
               • one Complementary Course deleted; 
               • Elective Courses credit weight decreased. 
               Program revisions approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
         4)   Desautels Faculty of Management 
  
                B.Com. in General Management; Accounting Concentration (15 cr.) 

                Program revision: 
                • one Complementary Course added. 
                Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
              B.Com. in General Management; Organizational Behaviour Concentration (15 cr.) 

              Program revisions: 
              • title; 

               • one Complementary Course added. 
              Program revisions approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
              B.Com. in General Management; Strategic Management Concentration – Social Context (15 cr.) 

              Program revisions: 
              • Required Courses heading revised to read “Complementary Courses; 
              • how courses chosen revised; 
              • Complementary Courses credit weight increased. 
              Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
              B.Com.; Major in Psychology for Management Students (30 cr.) 

              Program revisions: 
              • one Complementary Course deleted; 
              • two Complementary Courses added; 
              • Complementary Courses descriptive sentence concerning 6 credits revised; 
              • “Option” headings within program revised to read “Stream”. 
              Program revisions approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 
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          5)    Faculty of Medicine 
 
               M.Eng. in Biomedical Engineering; Bioinformatics (45 cr.) 

                  Program revision: 
               • one Complementary Course added. 
             Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
             Ph.D. in Biomedical Engineering; Bioinformatics (0 cr.) 

                  Program revision: 
               • one Complementary Course added. 
             Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
             M.Sc. in Physiology; Bioinformatics (49 cr.) 

                  Program revision: 
               • one Complementary Course added. 
             Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
             Ph.D. in Physiology; Bioinformatics (0 cr.) 

                 Program revision: 
               • one Complementary Course added. 
             Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
             M.Sc. in Biochemistry; Bioinformatics (45 cr.) 

                 Program revision: 
              • one Complementary Course added. 
            Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
            Ph.D. in Biochemistry; Bioinformatics (0 cr.) 

                 Program revision: 
              • one Complementary Course added. 
            Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
            M.Sc. in Human Genetics; Bioinformatics (45 cr.) 

                Program revision: 
              • one Complementary Course added. 
            Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
            Ph.D. in Human Genetics; Bioinformatics (0 cr.) 

                 Program revision: 
              • ne Complementary Course added. 
            Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
      6)    Schulich School of Music 
  
              M.Mus. in Performance; Solo (45 cr.) 

              Program revisions: 
              • Elective Courses revised to read “Complementary Courses”; 
              • Complementary Courses specific prefix seminar descriptive sentence revised. 
              Program revisions approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
              M.Mus. in Performance; Chamber Music (48 cr.) 

              Program revisions: 
              • Elective Courses revised to read “Complementary Courses”; 
              • Complementary Courses specific prefix seminar descriptive sentence revised. 
              Program revisions approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
              M.Mus. in Performance; Solo Piano (49 cr.) 

              Program revisions: 
              • Elective Courses revised to read “Complementary Courses”; 
              • Complementary Courses specific prefix seminar descriptive sentence revised. 
              Revised program approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
              M.Mus. in Performance; Chamber Music – Piano (49 cr.) 

              Program revisions: 
              • Elective Courses revised to read “Complementary Courses”; 
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              • Complementary Courses specific prefix seminar descriptive sentence revised. 
              Revised program approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
              M.Mus. in Performance; Piano Accompaniment (45 cr.) 

              Program revisions: 
              • Elective Courses revised to read “Complementary Courses”; 
              • Complementary Courses specific prefix seminar descriptive sentence revised. 
              Revised program approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

              M.Mus. in Performance; Orchestral Training (45 cr.) 

              Program revisions: 
              • Elective Courses revised to read “Complementary Courses”; 
              • Complementary Courses specific prefix seminar descriptive sentence revised. 
              Program revisions approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
              M.Mus. in Performance; Opera Performance (45 cr.) 

              Program revisions: 
              • Elective Courses revised to read “Complementary Courses”; 
              • Complementary Courses specific prefix seminar descriptive sentence revised. 
              Revised program approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
               M.Mus. in Performance; Vocal Opera Coach (45 cr.) 

               Program revisions: 
               • Elective Courses revised to read “Complementary Courses”; 
               • Complementary Courses specific prefix seminar descriptive sentence revised. 
               Revised program approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
              M.Mus. in Performance; Vocal Performance (49 cr.) 

              Program revisions: 
              • Elective Courses revised to read “Complementary Courses”; 
              • Complementary Courses specific prefix seminar descriptive sentence revised. 
              Revised program approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
              M.Mus. in Performance; Vocal Pedagogy (47 cr.) 

              Program revisions: 
              • Elective Courses revised to read “Complementary Courses”; 
              • Complementary Courses specific prefix seminar descriptive sentence revised. 
              Program revisions approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
             M.Mus. in Performance; Early Music (48 cr.) 

             Program revisions: 
             • Elective Courses revised to read “Complementary Courses”; 
             • Complementary Courses specific prefix seminar descriptive sentence revised. 
             Revised program approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

 
             M.Mus. in Performance; Church Music (45 cr.) 

             Program revisions: 
             • Elective Courses revised to read “Complementary Courses”; 
             • Complementary Courses specific prefix seminar descriptive sentence revised. 
             Revised program approved by SCTP on 25

th
 January 2007. 

               
              B.Mus.; Major in Performance; Piano (96 cr.) 

              Program revisions: 
              • two Complementary Courses added. 
              Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
              B.Mus.; Honours in Performance; Piano (99 cr.) 

              Program revisions: 
              • two Complementary Courses added. 
              Program revisions approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
              L.Mus. in Piano (95 cr.) 

              Program revisions: 
              • two Complementary Courses added. 
              Program revisions approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 
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      7)    Faculty of Science 
  
              M.Sc. in Biology; Bioinformatics (48 cr.) 

                 Program revision: 
              • one Complementary Course added. 
            Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
            Ph.D. in Biology; Bioinformatics (0 cr.) 

                 Program revision: 
              • one Complementary Course added. 
            Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
            M.Sc. in Computer Science; Bioinformatics (49 cr.) 

                Program revision: 
              • one Complementary Course added. 
            Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
            Ph.D. in Computer Science; Bioinformatics (0 cr.) 

                 Program revision: 
              • one Complementary Course added. 
            Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
             M.Sc. in Mathematics and Statistics; Bioinformatics (48 cr.) 

                  Program revision: 
               • one Complementary Course added. 
              Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
              Ph.D. in Mathematics and Statistics; Bioinformatics (0 cr.) 

                  Program revision: 
                • one Complementary Course added. 
              Revised program approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

 
              B.Sc.; Major in Neuroscience (67 cr.) 

               Program revisions: 
                 • one Required Course added, along with descriptive sentence concerning alternative; 
                 • Required Courses credit weight increased; 
                 • multiple Complementary Courses added to and deleted from streams within program; 
                 • how Complementary Courses to be chosen revised; 
                 • descriptive sentence added to end of list of Complementary Courses; 
                 • program credit weight increased. 
                 Program revisions approved by SCTP on 8

th
 February 2007. 

                
     (C)  Other issues 

 

        None 
 

III. FOR THE INFORMATION OF SENATE 

 
(A) NEW COURSES (approved by the Subcommittee on Courses and Teaching Programs of APPC on 25

th
 

January and 8
th

 February 2007) 
 

1)  Faculty of Agricultural and Environmental Sciences 
 
        BTEC 555 Structural Bioinformatics (3 cr.) 
        PLNT 315 Herbs and Medicinal Plants (3 cr.) 
        NRSC 694 M.Sc. Thesis Research 4 (9 cr.) 
          PARA 691 Thesis Research 5 (6 cr.)  
        FDSC 538 Food Science in Perspective (3 cr.) 
 
   2)  Faculty of Arts 
  
        SOCI 446 Colonialism and Society (3 cr.) 
        ENVR 519 Global Environmental Politics (3 cr.) 
        ENVR 544 Env. Measurement & Modelling (3 cr.) 
        ENVR 620 Environ and Health of Species (3 cr.) 
        ENVR 622 Sustainable Landscapes (3 cr.) 
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        ENVR 630 Civilization and Environment 1 (3 cr.) 
        ENVR 631 Civilization and Environment 2 (3 cr.) 
        ENVR 650 Environmental Seminar 1 (1 cr.) 
        ENVR 651 Environmental Seminar 2 (1 cr.) 
        ENVR 652 Environmental Seminar 3 (1 cr.) 
        WMST 601 Feminist Theories and Methods (3 cr.) 
        WMST 602 Feminist Research Symposium (3 cr.) 
        HIST 409 Themes: Latin American Hist 2 (3 cr.) 
        HIST 474 History of the GULAG 1918-1991 (3 cr.) 
        SOCI 603 Bibliographic Methods 1 (3 cr.) 
        SOCI 604 Bibliographic Methods 2 (3 cr.). 
        ECON 654 Research Methods in Economics (3 cr.) 
        ECON 675 Analysis of Macro Policy (3 cr.) 
        ECON 770 PhD Research Seminar 1 (1 cr.) 
        ECON 771 PhD Research Seminar 2 (1 cr.) 
 
            3)  Faculty of Education 
  
        EDEC 216 Aboriginal Language Req. (0 cr.) [SCTP January 11, 2007] 
 
   4)   Faculty of Science 
  
         PHGY 425 Analyzing Physiological Sys. (3 cr.) 
         PHGY 560 Light Microscopy-Life Science (3 cr.) 
   

(B) COURSE REVISIONS (approved by the Subcommittee on Courses and Teaching Programs of APPC on 

25
th

 January and 8
th

 February 2007) 
 

1)  Faculty of Agricultural and Environmental Sciences 
 
        NRSC 391 Scientific Communication (2 cr.)  
        PLNT 321 Fruit Production (3 cr.) 
        PLNT 353 Plant Structure and Function (4 cr.) 
        FDSC 110 General Chemistry 1 (4 cr.) 
        NUTR 307 Human Nutrition (3 cr.) 
        AGRI 452 Water Resources in Barbados (3 cr.) 
        AGRI 519 Sustainable Development Plans (6 cr.)  
 
   2)  Faculty of Arts 
  
        ANTH 202 Comparative Cultures (3 cr.) 
        ANTH 780 Reading and Research 1 (3 cr.)  
        ANTH 781 Reading and Research 2 (3 cr.) 
 
             3)  Faculty of Engineering 
  
                  CIVE 452 Water Resources in Barbados (3 cr.) 
                  CIVE 519 Sustainable Development Plans (6 cr.) 
                  URBP 519 Sustainable Development Plans (6 cr.) [SCTP January 11, 2007] 
 
             4)  Desautels Faculty of Management 
  
                  ACCT 351 Intermediate Financial Acct. (3 cr.)  
                  ACCT 361 Intermediate Management Acct. (3 cr.)  
                  ACCT 453 Advanced Financial Accounting (3 cr.)  
                  ACCT 454 Financial Reporting (3 cr.)  
                  ACCT 455 Development of Acct Thought (3 cr.)  
                  ACCT 463 Advanced Management Accounting (3 cr.)  
                  ACCT 471 Non-Profit Accounting (3 cr.)  
                  ACCT 476 Internal Auditing (3 cr.)  
                  ACCT 477 External Auditing (3 cr.)  
                  FINE 342 Finance 2 (3 cr.) 
                  MGCR 271 Business Statistics (3 cr.)  
                  MGCR 472 Operations Management (3 cr.)  
                  MGSC 272 Advanced Business Statistics (3 cr.)  
                  ORGB 409 Organizational Research Methods (3 cr.)  
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                  ORGB 424 Employment (3 cr.)  
                  ORGB 426 Human Resource Train & Develop (3 cr.)  
                  ORGB 525 Compensation Management (3 cr.)  
 
            5)   Schulich School of Music 
  
                  MUJZ 640 Jazz Composition & Arranging 1 (2 cr.) 
                  MUJZ 641 Jazz Composition & Arranging 2 (2 cr.) 
 
               6)  Faculty of Science 
  
              PHGY 209 Mammalian Physiology 1 (3 cr.)  
              PHGY 210 Mammalian Physiology 2 (3 cr.)  
              PHGY 311 Channels, Synapses & Hormones (3 cr.) 
              PHGY 314 Integrative Neuroscience (3 cr.)  
  

  (C)   Retirements   

 
     1) Programs 

 
      None 
 
               2) Courses 

    
                a) Faculty of Agricultural and Environmental Sciences 
 
           NRSC 491 Scientific Communication 1 (1 cr.) 
           NRSC 492 Scientific Communication 2 (1 cr.) 
           NRSC 681 Special Topics 2 (1 cr.) 
           NRSC 683 Special Topics 4 (2 cr.) 
           ENTO 726 Insect Population Dynamics (3 cr.) 
           WILD 310 Air Photo and Imagery Interpretation (3 cr.) 
           AGEC 495D1/D2, N1/N2 Project (3 cr.) 
           AGEC 640 Agri & Food Marketing (3 cr.) 
           FDSC 510 Food Hydrocolloid Chemistry (3 cr.)  
           PLNT 766 Ph.D. Thesis 1 (0 cr.)  
           PLNT 767 Ph.D. Thesis 2 (0 cr.) 
           PLNT 768 Ph.D. Thesis 3 (0 cr.) 
 
               b)   Desautels Faculty of Management 
 
                     MGCR 213 Intro to Management Accounting (3 cr.)  
                     MGCR 320 Managing Human Resources (3 cr.)  
 
               c)   Schulich School of Music 
 
          MUEN 678 Chamber Winds (2 cr.) 
          MUPG 600 Seminar in Pedagogy 1 (3 cr.) 
          MUPG 601 Seminar in Pedagogy 2 (3 cr.) 
          MUPG 603 Brass Instrum Perf&Repertoire (3 cr.) 
          MUPG 604 String Instrum Perf&Repertoire (3 cr.) 
          MUPG 605 Piano Pedagogy & Materials (3 cr.) 
          MUPG 610 Qualifying Conducting Tutorial (4 cr.) 
          MUPG 614 Directed Teaching 4 (2 cr.) 
          MUPG 615 Master Class-Orchest Conduct (3 cr.) 
          MUPG 616 Master Class-Choral Conducting (3 cr.) 
          MUPG 617 Master Class-Wind Band Conduct (3 cr.) 
          MUPG 630 Performance Tutorial 6 (6 cr.) 
          MUPG 631 Performance Tutorial 7 (6 cr.) 
          MUPG 632 Performance Tutorial 8 (6 cr.) 
          MUPG 633 Performance Tutorial 9 (6 cr.) 
          MUPG 651D1/D2 Pedagogy Comprehensive Exam (6 cr.) 
          MUPG 666, D1/D2 Conducting Concert Examination (24 cr.) 
          MUPG 669, D1/D2 Accompanying Recital 2 (12 cr.) 
          MUPG 683 The Pianist as Partner (3 cr.) 
          MUPG 687 Dev-Woodwind Instruments (3 cr.) 
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          MUPG 698 20th-Century Wind Repertoire (3 cr.) 
          MUEN 485 Mixed Ensemble (1 cr.) 
          MUEN 499 String Ensemble (1 cr.) 
          MUEN 672 Cappella Antica (2 cr.)  
          MUEN 673 Collegium Musicum (2 cr.)  
          MUEN 679 Advanced Song Interpretation (1 cr.) 
          MUEN 680 Early Music Ensemble (1 cr.)  
          MUEN 692 Advanced Chamber Jazz Ensemble (2 cr.)  
          MUEN 693 Choral Ensemble (2 cr.)  
          MUEN 694 Contemporary Music Ensemble (2 cr.)  
          MUEN 695 Jazz Ensemble (2 cr.)  
          MUEN 697 Orchestra (2 cr.) 
  
     
  Total number of program retirements reported:   0 
  Total number of course/term retirements reported: 46 

 
 
 

    Compiled by Helen M.C. Richard, 2007-03-15 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
   


